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We do seem to have had all the types 

of weather possible in the last week! 

 

 
 

However, we are so impressed with 

the Newby Team who have worked 
through it all and finished our 

magnificent new Early Years outdoor 

area. I am sure you will all agree that 
this is a great addition to our school. 

Next plan will be to develop the 

outdoor area for KS1 and KS2. Watch 
this space! 

 

 
*******************************************  

Homework 

 
This term we have sent homework 
books to enable a more consistent 

system across the school. Your class 
teachers will have informed you when 
the homework is due back to school 

for assessing. We understand that at 
times it is difficult to fit everything in. 
however, to enable us to monitor 

progress and certainly for the older 
children, to prepare them for 
secondary school, we do expect the 

homework to be completed. If your 
child does not complete their 
homework on a second occasion 

during a short term, you will receive a 
telephone call to see if we can 
support in any way and to address 

any issues there may be. Please let 
your class teacher know if your child 
is experiencing any difficulties with 

completing the homework. 
 

******************************************* 

 
 

******************************************* 

 
Clothing Collection 

 

We will be sending home with each 
child a bag to collect any unwanted 
clothing. Starlight will collect the bags 

on Wednesday 11th May. Please 
bring your unwanted clothing items in 
the week beginning 9th May and leave 

them in the reception area. 
Unfortunately they cannot accept 
bric-a-brac, toys, pants, socks, 

bedding, blankets, rugs, school 
uniform or ripped or wet clothing. We 
will receive a donation for our school 

fund and a percentage will go directly 
to the charity Starlight which works 
for: 

‘Brightening the lives of seriously and 
terminally ill children.’ 

 

******************************************* 
 

Tully Cup 

 
This term, our school value is 

Service. 

The children will be encouraged to 
reflect on the way Jesus exemplified 

in his person, ministry and 

relationship with God, what it was to 
be called the ‘servant king’. Christians 

believe that their calling is to follow 

Jesus’ example according to their 
gifts or abilities. 

Winners this week: 

 
KS 1 – Issy Hind  
KS 2 – Lydia Tier 

 
******************************************* 

Attendance  

 
Overall this week 
25 – 29 th  April 

96.77% 
 

******************************************* 

 

 
******************************************* 

 

E-Safety 
 

Please try your best to attend our E-

Safety workshop for parents on 
Tuesday 3rd May at 3.30pm. There 

will be a huge amount of really 

valuable information shared and an 
opportunity to ask questions. We all 
want to keep our children as safe as 

possible in this world of technology. 
 

***************************************** 

 
After- School Clubs 

 

Wednesday – Breakin’ habit 
Wednesday – Year 6 homework 

Thursday – Coach Chris Year 3/4 

 
***************************************** 

 
 

Diary Dates - Summer  
 

Please note a change of date for 
sports day – Thursday 30thh June 

not Tuesday 28th June. 
 

02.05.16 MAYDAY 
03.05.16 E safety day LCSB 

Session for parents 
3.30 

04.05.16 Year 5 Class Assembly 
09.05.16 SATS week Year 6 

11.05.16 Year 4 Class Assembly 
18.05.16 Year 3 Class Assembly 

25.05.16 Year 2 Class Assembly 
27.05.16 End of Term 5 

06.06.16 Return to school 
 

 
 

***************************************** 
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